
To: Stacey JoannEIMMI 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent Tue 5/22/2018 10:55:16 AM 
Subject: Re: 

thank you...I will speak with Jeffrey today on this! 

On May 21, 2018, at 3:00 PM, Stacey Joanne  

Hi Lesley 
I used the following dates on Skyscanner. 
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I am also holding the flights with a travel agent and have to pay for it by May 24 just in 

case. 

I have been trying other search engines but it's coming out to more. I will keep looking. 

Best, 
Joanne 

On Mon, May 21, 2018 at 10:36 AM, Lesley Groff ote: 

super. thanks 

• AM, Stacey Joanne 
wrote: 

Yes of course. 

On Fri, May 18, 2018 at 4:54 PM, Lesley Groff < wrote: 

HI Joanne... Jeffrey is asking if you could have a look at flights 
yourself and get back to me what would work for you...Can you 
check on line and then pass along the details to me please? 

> On May 18, 2018, at 12:35 PM, Stacey Joanne > wrote: 
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> Hi Lesley. 

> Thank you ... he is good. He needed to have dental surgery cause his teeth arc 
really bad. He is my lil old man lol. 

> I need to be in Split Croatia on June 29 and I can leave on July 8. I was thinking 
that I can fly direct to Rome from NYC on June 25 or 26 and then I 
can take a flight from Rome to Slit on June 29. 

> June 25 or 26 
> NYC to Rome 

> June 29 
> Rome to Split 

> July 8 
> Split to NYC 

> Best, 
> Joanne 
> <Passport.pdf> 
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