To:  Rich Kann |

From: Lesley Groff
Sent: Thur 8/772018 2:11:45 PM

Subject: Re: Today's call

12:30pm is fine! lets move it. [ will email Jeffrey that | confirmed 12:30pm

On Jun 7, 2018, at 10:08 AM, Richard Kahn -:_:-*- wWrote:

no answer from jee yet..

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

On Jun 7, 2018, at 9:52 AM, Lesley Gmﬁ‘--‘:_:-

wrolc:

thanks... 12:30pm should be just fine...let me know if Jeffrey does not answer.. He
15 at an out of the house appointment until around 11:15am

On Jun 7. 2018, at 9:43 AM . Richard Kahn

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022
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Begin forwarded message:

From: Jillian Hirsch

Subject: Re: Today's call
Date: June 7, 2018 at 9:42:35 AM EDT
To: Richard Kahn

<

=

Can we move our call to
12:30pm? | have a
meeting at 10am that may
run long. If that doesn't
work, | will make myself
available at noon.

On Jun 7, 2018 at 9:06
AM, <Richard Kahn>
wrote:

Noam will not be on call today
Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York. NY 10022
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On Jun 7, 2018, at
8:36 AM, Jillian
Hirsch
<

wrote:

Richard,

| understand a call has been
scheduled for noon (Eastern time)
today. | look forward to speaking.

Does Noam plan to participate in
the call? If so, Harry will
participate as well (and we should
circulate a call-in number — do you
have one you'd like to use?). If
Moam does not plan to participate,
you and | can proceed on our own.

Regards,
Jillian

Jillian B. Hirsch | Attorney at
Law
<image001.png=>

www hirschlawlle.com

This message contains PRIVILEGED
AMND CONFIDENTIAL INFORMATION
intended solely for the use of the
addressee(s) named above. Any
disclosure, distribution, copying or
use of the information by others is
strictly prohibited. If you have

EFTA_R1_01029998
EFTA02248828



received this message in error, please
notify the sender by immediate reply
and delete the original message.
Thank you.
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