
To: 
Fran: 
Sent 
Subject 

I 
Lesley Groff 
Wed 6/6/2018 3:17:44 PM 
Re: Plans for Friday/moving forward? 

oh my! OK, I will reserve the car and the hotel through my travel rep...same deal, you pay with 
your card and Bella will wire you the funds... 

On Jun 6, 2018, at 11:05 AM, wrote:

Hey Lesley , i didn't book anything . 

Envoye de mon iPhone 

Le 6 juin 2018 a 16:19, Lesley Groff a &fit : 

sounds great! So for now I do not need to do anything for you, 
correct? has taken care of the car rental on 8th and the hotel 8-
10 at Sheraton...yes? 

On Jun 6 2018 at 10:00 AM, 
<MM > wrote: 

Hi Lesley! We arc still figuring out things, but the plan is for now: 
So trip is: 
June 5th-8th Li n; Altos Avenida hotel 
June 7th hotel 
June 8th take a car(4 hours)= to oP rto

Car: Avis Aluguer de Carros Lisboa - Hotel 
Mundial, 
Address to pick up the car : Praga Martim Moniz 
2B, 1100-198 Lisboa, Portugal 

Accommodation: Sheraton hotel 

https://www.starwoodhotels.com/preferredguest/roo 
m. html?propertvl D=14548,departureDate=2018-06-
108dengthOfStav=2&arrival Date= 2018-06-
088docaleCode=en US&numberOfRooms=2&lanau 
acie=en LIS&numbenDfAdults=28,ES=LPS 1454 E 
N SI BOOKWIDGET OPO IB EAME&numberOf 
Children=0 
June 10th fl ight (2,5 hours) ===to Azores islands 
Azores Airlines 
S4 377 

EFTA_R1_01030036 
EFTA02248846



June 14th flight ( 11 hours) 
Azores (Funchal airport) ===to Sardinia ( Olbia 
airport) 
Accommodation on Sardinia??? ( ?) 
June 19th flights: 

easyJet U2 4218 ; 
9:45 am Olbia===Paris (ORY airport) 11:35 

Air Italy IG 1209; 
10:55 am Olbia===Milan ( LIN airport) 12:00 
ME II Duca Hotel from 19th till any day Jeffrey 
wants me in Paris ( probably till June 22) 

So, the nearest is the car rent on 81fAif to Porto 
and the hotel 8-10 Sheraton which has 
confirmed. 

Thank you so much for the help and organizing, 
Lesley!!!! 
I'm always in touch. 

On Jun 6 2018 at 12:42 PM, Lesley Groff 
wrote: 

Hi and We have you checking out of your hotel in Lisbon 
onFriday June 8th. What is the plan after 
this? Alesley 

Sent from my iPhonc 
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