
To: Amex Centurian Trave 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent: Thur 6/14/2018 1:57:41 PM 
Subject: Re: Tickets for from Milan to NY not received yet.... 

oh my! can you tell I was typing on my cell and did not look at what I typed!? 
I meant to type: I received the invoices but... 
thank you for deciphering :) 

On Jun 14, 2018, at 9:56 AM, Natalia Molotkova 

wrote:

Yes. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

t ceiling bed the invoices but not the nicely printed itineraries. Can you forward ? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jun 14, 2018, at 9:22 AM, Natalia Molotkova < wrote: 

You should have it by now...Was done this morning ( a lot of record on Q, they were doing it by travel date at 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Hi Natasha...1 have not received the tickets for to fly from Milan to NY on June 17th...is this 
wanted to follow up on this! :) 
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