
To: Dangene Enterprise 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent Tue 6/5/2018 8:29:29 PM 
Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein 

ok, so lets keep Thursday 9am on the books if we do not reconvene by 5:00pm today 

On Jun 5, 2018, at 4:28 PM, Appointment <  wrote: 

By 530 pm latest today...and if I find out sooner I will let you know! 

Best, 

Kristhle 
Client Specialist 
@dangene 
Dan ene: The Institute of Skinovation 

On 6/5/18, 4:27 PM, "Lesley Groff' wrote: 

let me tell Jeffrey Thursday may not be available and see if he prefers to confirm 7am 
tomorrow or keep fingers crossed for Thurs...how late can I get back to you on 
this? 

• Appointment 
> wrote: 

Nothing at the moment, however, we can revisit tomorrow? We never know-
cancellation may happen! 

Best, 

Kristhle 
Client Specialist 
@dangene 
Dan me: The Institute of Skinovation 
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On 6/5/18, 4:21 PM, "Lesley Groff' wrote: 

yes please..or is there another time on Thursday that would be a definant? 

8 4:18 PM Appointment 
wrote: 

Ahh...slight chance pelleve may not be available on Thursday. Do you still 
want the appointment? 

Best, 

Kristhle 
Client Specialist 
®dangene 
Dan ene: The Institute of Skinovation 

On 6/5/18, 4:13 PM, "Lesley Groff c • wrote: 

YES! Let's take that instead..Greatly appreciate it! 

On Jun 5 2018 at 4:12 PM Appointment 
wrote: 

We can do 9am on Thursday instead? 

Best, 

Kristhle 
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Client Specialist 
@dangene 
Dangene: The Institute of Skinovation 

On 6/5/18, 4:00 PM, "Lesley Groff" Milla wrote: 

Actually, I just spoke to Jeffrey and he is wondering if he could come 
in on Thursday June 7 some time...any 
availability? 

On Jun 5, 2018, at 3:34 PM, 
Appointment 

wrote: 

We have lam available ? 

Best, 

Kristhle 
Client Specialist 
@dangene 
Dangenc: The Institute of Slcinovation 

On 6/5/18, 3:31 PM, "Lesley Groff' 
wrote: 

Hello ALL! Jeffrey is in NY and asking if he could come in for a 
`Pelleve' tomorrow, WEd. June 
6th, before 10:30am? 
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Possible? 

Please let me know. 

Thanks Lesley 
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