
To: Ramon Alonso Ocej 
Cc: melinaaradyca.com 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent Mon 6/11/2018 4:10:30 PM 
Subject Re: Invoice 

Hi Lorena. Email received...1 will forward on to accounting... 
thanks, Lesley 

On Jun 11, 2018, at 10:09 AM, Lorena Villacorta wrote: 

Good morning Lesley, 

Hope this email finds you wet. 
Attached you can find the invoice for the trip to the Island that was cancelled for May 299" to 
June 
Unfortunately we couldn't get the refund , but we have the tickets on hold for next trip. 
Please let me know if you have any questions. Attached you can see the wired instruction. 

Have a good day! 

Lorena Villacorta 
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