
To: 
From: Dawn Waniewski 
Sent Wed 6/13/2018 6:28:03 PM 
Subject: Re: so#71462 

morning - call me at = we have the dornbracht item in -
what is your phone number? 

dawn 

On Tue, Jun 12, 2018 at 7:08 AM, > wrote:

ok, good. thank you! 

On Jun 12, 2018, at 10:05 AM, Dawn Waniewski <O> wrote: 

6/12/18 
Morning - we have movement - will let you know when we get into san diego 

dawn 

On Mon, Jun 11, 2018 at 12:07 PM, wrote: 

Hi Dawn...what did you find out? 
thanks! 

On Jun 11, 2018, at 10:38 AM, Dawn Waniewski 

wrote: 

morning - calling dombracht -
dawn 

On Fri, Jun 8, 2018 at 3:22 PM, wrote: 

Hi Dawn and thank you for calling Dornbrecht. I think Plumbtile 
needs to provide a tax ID to fed ex in order to get through 
customs. I could be wrong but maybe call fed ex and ask what they 
need from you (the importer). ? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jun 8, 2018, at 5:43 PM, Dawn Waniewski dc > wrote: 
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I was told from Dombracht - they have supplied 
costumes with all the correct paperwork - and no 
waiting on them to push this package through - 

will keep tracking - very sorry 

dawn 

On Fri, Jun 8, 2018 at 1:18 PM, 

thank you! 

On Jun 8, 2018, at 4:17 PM, Dawn 
Waniewski 
wrote: 

calling vendor right now 
dawn 

On Fri, Jun 8, 2018 at 12:30 PM, 
wrote: 

Fed Ex#4413 6674 0944 

HI Dawn...I just looked at the fed ex 
tracking information again and the 
package is awaiting clearance 
instructions from the importer 
(you)... Says you need to provide the 
required registration/identification 
number...examples: EIN, SSN, VAT, 
GST, etc. 

al  niyou can help resolve this issue! 

On May 30, 2018, at 5:41 
PM, Dawn Waniewski 

wrote: 

thank you - will continue - and yes - send you tracking 
number when available 

dawn 

Wrote: 
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On Wed, May 30, 2018 at 2:39 PM, 

wrote: 

All correct! 
Please do charge our card 
Can you provide a 
tracking number for 
package once you have 
one? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On May 30, 2018, at 5:09 PM, Dawn Wanicwski 

wrote: 

5/30/18 
Thank you for 
the order -
please review 
to make sure 
all is correct 
and if so -
please allow 
me to charge 
your 
card ending in 
the last four 
numbers 
in the amount 
of 782.52. 

Thank ou - dawn 

Dawn Waniewski 
International Bath & Tile 
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