
To: 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Thur 6/7/2018 2:55:53 PM 
Subject: Re: Call James Patracelli re NY St. Ins. Fund-we have a credit 

ok 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New 
tel 
fax 
cel 

> On Jun 7, 2018, at 10:54 AM, wrote: 

> • Please call James Patracelli re NY St. Insurance fund re a credit we have-he 
wants to make sure you pay proper amount 
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