From:

Sent: Mon 6/18/2018 3:.53:

Subject: Re: Ticket for

Please issue below ticket as shown for- thanks

On Jun 18, 2018, at 11:50 AM, Natalia Molotkova
WTOte:

Your response is required to complete this reservation. Prices and availability are subject to change.
+ Total air reservation, including taxes and fees: $560.40.

+ Ticketis non-refundable, changes are not PERMITTED.

* Sun 24 Jun - Air France 1753 - Economy - 3h 20m

Departing: Boryspil Intl Airport, Kiev (KBP) at 2.45pm

Arriving: Paris Charles de Gaulle Airport, (CDG) at 5.05pm

+ Wed 27 Jun - Air France 1652 - Economy - 3h Om

Departing: Paris Charles de Gaulle Airport, (CDG) at 8.40pm

Arriving: Boryspil Intl Airport, Kiev (KBP) at 12.40am

Please reply to this email and provide your authorization to proceed.
Regards,

Natalia (Matasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Jeffrey has decided to go with Option 1!. Can you please purchase this ticket for her? thanks
OPTION 1:

1 AF 17593 24JUN KBF CDG 0245P 0505P
2 AF 1652 27JUN CDG KBFP 0840P 1240A

TOTAL FARE - USD 560.40

ok, | will come back to you.

wrote:

On Jun 18, 2018, at 11:12 AM, Natalia Molotkova
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$842.40 non ref and 892.40 refundable.

Outbound available only in business.

1 AF /PS 3375 24JUN KBP CDG 0955A 1220P
OPERATED BY UKRAINE INTERNATIONAL AIRLINES
2 AF 1652 27JUN CDG KBP 0840P 1240A

Regards,
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-330PM EST

that may be better...what is the evening return and the price for ticket please?

On Jun 18, 2018, at 11:04 AM, Natalia Molotkova _ wrote:

The only other f=direct flight option will be Ukrainian Air , at 9:55a, arriving Paris at 12:20pm.

Regards,
Natalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relatiunshii Manaier

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

| have been told she needs to arrive in the afternoon...so is there something arriving around 2pm-ish..?

On Jun 18, 2018, at 10:14 AM, Natalia Malntkwa_ wrote:

1 AF 1753 24JUN KBP CDG 0245P 0505P
2 AF 1652 27JUN CDG KBP 0840P 1240A

TOTAL FARE - USD 560.40
Regards,

Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Hi Natasha....we need a round trip, coach ticket for_from Kiev on June 24th afternoon t

EFTA_R1_01032178
EFTA02249645



Ta learn more about e-mail security or report a suspicious e-mail, please visit us at

© 2015 American Express. All rights resanved

American Express uses Jrd party concierge service providers who are not authorized to act on behalf of American Express and you acknowledge that Amer
Express is in no way responsible or liable for the actions of the service provider and the only remedy for any claims relating to services or products provided

service provider IS against the service provider and not against American Express. You ame responsible for any purchases, shipping charges and/or fees you
authorize. We resarve the right fo note profile and preference data for servicing purposes.

EFTA_R1_01032179
EFTA02249646



