
To: 
Cc: Bella Klei 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Tue 6/12/2018 12:38:31 PM 
Subject Re: Amex charge for JE 

thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

On Jun 12, 2018, at 7:57 AM, wrote: 

Yes. It arrived PB when he was there last 

Sent from my iPhonc 

On Jun 12, 2018, at 7:56 AM, Richard Kahn • > wrote: 

has this been received? 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel
fa 
cel 
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On May 25, 2018, at 7:46 PM, Bella Klein 
Ic * wrote: 

• 
Did JE requested subscription ? We cancelled same subscription a few weeks 

back as kit was not ready yet and they had no idea when 
it will be available. 

Thank you, 

Bella 

On May 25, 2018, at 1:35 PM,I 
wrote: 

Hi Bella...you will see an Amex charge for $399 ...it is for "Biome 
testing" it is some sort of kit being sent to JE 
through Deepak Chopra from CA...it could 
state it is a "micro biome kit"...not 
sure...but wanted you to know..I gave the 
CC # today to Deepak's office. 
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