
To: IMPOPOIMMIIIMIP 
From: Bella Klein 
Sent Mon 6/18/2018 4:14:54 PM 
Subject Re: Invoice Milano 

Wire sent! 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

On Jun 18, 2018, at 10:24 AM, wrote: 

Yes . I think so . This is the invoice that they gave me when I Checked out . 

Envoye de mon iPhone 

Le 18 juin 2018 a 10:19, Bella Klein .4: > a ecrit : 

Did I already pay for the hotel? 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

On Jun 18 2018 at 12:05 AM, 
wrote: 

Hey Bella , how are you ? This is a girls dinner at the hotel that I had to put in 
my room . Is it possible to refund me the amount please ? 
Thank you by advance . 

Envoye de mon iPhone<imagelbeg> 
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