
To: Amex Centurian Trave 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent: Wed 7/11/2018 3:15:24 PM 
Subject: Re: Ticket for ASAP 

HI Natasha...yes, Originally I requested to issue the ticket for from St. P to Moscow as 
stated below.l was on the phone last night with your partner for almost 2 hours dealing with 
changes to many tickets..I'm sure you sec it all today! crazy 

On Jul I I, 2018, at I I :02 AM, Natalia Molotkova 

wrote: 

Lesley, please respond, even if ticket was voided, that you originally was OK with one way ticket. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Lesley, morning, may I have your OK on disclosure below? Due to I did issue one way ticket (I know you cha 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Your response is required to complete this reservation. Prices and availability are subject to change. 
• Total air reservation, including taxes and fees: $136.50. 
• Ticket is non-refundable, $37.00 change penalty applies plus difference in fare 
• Fri 13 Jul - Aeroflot 17 - Economy - 1h 20m 
Departing: Pulkovo Airport, St. Petersburg (LED) at 1.50pm 
Arriving: Moscow Sheremetyevo Airport, (SVO) at 3.10pm 

Please reply to this email and provide your authorization to proceed. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

forget it! we like what you found! 

On Jul 10, 2018, at 5:47 PM, Natalia Molotkova <  wrote: 
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What about Ural Air? 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

yes, issue ticket for as below! 

On Jul 10, 2018, at 5:41 PM, Natalia Molotkova wrote: 

SU 17 13JUL LED SVO 0150P 0310P 

TOTAL FARE - USD 136.50 
I am about to leave for the day, do you wish issue ticket? 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Now wants a flight from st p to Moscow this Friday July 13. ! 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jul 10, 2018, at 5:26 PM, Natalia Molotkova < wrote: 

On it. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

We need a ticket for departing St. Petersburg tomorrow to paris on Aeroflot either at 9am or 13:00 I th 
to Moscow. Thank 

Sent from my iPhone 

Privacy Statement I it the Centurion Card website 
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To learn more about e-mail security or report a suspicious e-mail. please visit us at 
42 2015 American Express. All rights reserved 
American Express uses 3rd party concierge senate provklers who are not authorized to act on behalf of American Express and you acknowledge that Amer 
Express is in no way responsible or liable for the actions of the service provider and the only remedy for any claims relating to services or products provided 
service provider is against the service provider and not against American Express. You are responsible for any purchases. shipping charges andror fees you 
authorize. We reserve the right to note profile and preference data for servicing purposes. 
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