
To: James Bryant • Ila Klein 
Cc: David Mitchell{ 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent: Mon 8/6/2018 1:43:57 PM 
Subject: Re: Life Hotel-Jeffrey Epstein 

Thank you so much James. I am traveling and not able to print and fill out this form but have CCd 
Bella in our accounting dept. Bella, can you please help! 410 
David, as always, appreciate your help so very much! Lesley 

Sent from my iPlione 

On Aug 6, 2018, at 9:18 AM, James Bryant ‹ > wrote: 

Good Morning Lesley, 

I'll make these reservations myself right now and will have the email confirmations sent 
to you directly. I have also attached a credit card authorization for which will need to be 
filled out for payment. 

Regards, 

James 

From: David Mitchell < 
Sent: Monday, Au ust 6, 2018 9:03 AM 
To: Lesley Groff < 
Cc: James Bryant < 
Subject: Re: Life Hotel-Jeffrey Epstein 

James please meet Lesley 
Please give them my rate for both of these rooms 

James is our Hotel manager 

Lesley now that it is two rooms , shall we do King beds 

James please upgrade as well to VIP at no extra charge 

DAVID MITCHELL 

Mitchell Holdings LLC 
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On Aug 6, 2018, at 9:0O AM, Lesley Groff rote: 

David, Jeffrey is asking for 2 rooms and we will pay! The second room is 
for who do I give CC details to? 

Sent from my iPhone 
On Aug 6, 2018, at 8:08 AM, David Mitchell < 
wrote: 

is this a comp 

DAVID MITCHELL 

Mitchell Holdings LLC 

On Au 6 2018 at 8:03 AM, Lesley Groff 
wrote: 

Thank you! Two queen beds perfect. Name is 

Please send confirm once you have it so I may pass along to her. Really 
appreciate it. Lesley 

Sent from my iPhone 
On Au 5 2018 at 11:54 PM David Mitchell 

rote: 

Sure 

Name 

Two queens or one king 

DAVID MITCHELL 

Mitchell Holdings LLC 

On Aug 5, 2018, at 10:31 PM, 
Lesley Groff 
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wrote: 

Hi David! Hope you 
are well. Would it be 
possible to get one 
room at the life hotel 
for 2 of Jeffreys 
friends Tuesday Aug 
7-Friday Aug 10 (with 
late checkout on Aug 
10). ?? Alesley. 

Sent from my iPhone 
<Life Hotel CC Authorization Form.doc> 
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