
To: Richard KafhfaMI 
Cc: Lesley Gro 
From: CARLUZ TOYLO 
Sent Wed 7/18/2018 7:42:35 PM 
Subject Re: Vacation August 20 - September 17 

Hi Rich , 

Is there any chance that moving 2 days forward the 22nd instead of 20th would make a difference 
? Am sorry, completely forgot , Arline & 1 have a Doctors appointment on the 21st August, 
Thank you very much 

Carluz To lo 

On Jul 18, 2018, at 03:16 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 

Jee has approved the following dates and will pay for your tickets. Please 
coordinate purchase of tickets with Lesley. Thank you. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
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