
To: Lesley Groff 
From: Bella Klein 
Sent: Thur 6/28/2018 6:45:10 PM 
Subject: Re: JEE_Lesley Groff ch 1182_Petty cash reim Toefl and food_062818.pdf 

No need, i already did it. Next report you can do same way. I did not include 3 
receipts as one is duplicate and 2 I couldn't read date. If valid, please include 
in the next reimbursement. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

> On Jun 28, 2018, at 2:42 PM, Lesley Groff wrote: 

> oh wow—ok thanks Bella...I will work on the template and send today 

>> On Jun 28, 2018, at 2:40 PM, Bella Klein wrote: 

>> <JEE_Lesley Groff_ch 1182_Petty cash reim Toefl and food_062818.pdf> 
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