
To 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent Mon 7/23/2018 3:25:52 PM 
Subject: Re: 

having so much fun yet a bit sad when we said goodbye„ 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Jul 20, 2018, at 9:46 AM, 

You're too much! How is 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jul 20, 2018, at 9:12 AM, Richard Kahn 

Good question. I wish I knew the answer to that... 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Jul 20, 2018, at 7:23 AM, ote: 

wrote: 

I will simply void the tickets I bought yesterday and wait 

ote: 
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to receive confirmation of new dates. Why are you 
answering emails at 3:24am on vacation!! 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jul 20, 2018, at 3:24 AM, Richard Kahn 
wrote: 

Jee wrote email 1 day after i confirmed 
dates. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK A 

On Jul 19, 2018, at 10:31 PM, 
wrote: 

Did Carluz confirm these dates 
jeffrey is requesting they go as 
of yet? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jul 19, 2018, at 9:06 PM, Richard Kahn 

wrote: 

Wish you were on 
this email or that 
Carluz made you 
aware... 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
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Begin forwarded message: 

Date: July 18, 2018 at 7:11:54 PM EDT 
To: CARLUZ TOYLO 

From: 
"jetty 
E." 
<j ea 
cation 
Ramai 
I,com> 

Richar 
d Kahn 

wonde 
rewd 
whehte 
r 
carluz 
and 
arlenc 
could 
take 
aug 2 
till sept 
2 as 
vacatio 
n sept 
might 
be busy 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only 

for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
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JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly 

prohibi 
ted 

and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us 

immedi 
ately 
by 

return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jcevaca 
tion@g 
mail.co 
m, and 

destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights 

reserve 
d 
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