
To: 
Cc: lesleya 
From: Bella Klein 
Sent: Mon 7/9/2018 11:54:57 AM 
Subject: Re: Hotel Saint Petersburg 

Do you have more receipts 

Thank you, 

Bella 

> on Jul 9, 2018, at 7:45 AM, > wrote:

> • I paid the hotel in Saint Petersburg it was easier Here you can found the 
invoice . 
> <imagel.jpeg> 

> • Envoy* de mon iPhone 
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