
To: 
Cc: Lesley Groff 
Fran: Bella Klein 
Sent Tue 7/17/2018 6:34:34 PM 
Subject: Re: Hotel Moscow 

Wired 616.95 Euros 

Thank you, 
Bela 

Tel: 

On Jul 17, 2018, at 2:06 PM, an wrote: 

Good evening Bella , here you can found attached the bill of the hotel in Moscow . Is it 
possible to reimburse it ? Thank you 
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Envoye de mon iPhone 
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