
To: 
From: I P a ein 
Sent: Tue 7/31/2018 4:58:43 PM 
Subject: Re: FYI... 

ok 
Thank you, 
Bella 

> On Jul 31, 2018, at 9:45 AM, wrote: 

> • FYI-Jeffrey was at the hospital yesterday, July 30, having tests done...Karyna 
was with him...He had a severe allergic reaction to something...I know he had 
anesthesia for the tests, but I know nothing else...you will see bills I am sure, 
but they are not telling me specifics and I did not ask. Just wanted you to 
know. If you need confirmation of invoices, you will need to go to Jeffrey or 
Karyna_I think he may have doctor bills from Sunday July 29 as well_but not 
positive. 
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