To:  Lesiey cror

From: Bella Klein
Sent: Thur 7/19/2018 7:10:55 PM
Subject: Re: We Can Not PrePay rcr- Luggage...she will need to pay and get reimbursed if OK

with JE

ok

Thank you,

Bella

On Jul 19, 2018, at 2:54 PM, Lesley Groft <[ | G- o

fiyi...

Thank you

Begin forwarded message:

From: [ N
Subject: Re: We Can Not PrePay for Luggage...she

will need to pay and get reimbursed if OK with JE
Date: July 19, 2018 at 2:53:34 PM EDT
To: Lesley Groff <[

Envoyé de mon 1Phone

Le 19 juil. 2018 a 19:05, Lesley Groff < > a écrit :

We Can Not PrePay for - Luggage...she will need
to pay and get reimbursed if OK with JE
Below is the information she needs to know:

Flight on July 28, Aeroflot :

https:/iwww . aeroflot.rulru-en/before and after fly/baggage
| called airport, they said we can't prepay for the
overweight in advance, due to they have to weight it at the
airport. They told me she has two bags free up to 23 kg
each.

Alitalia on July 26 - one bag 23 kg (50 pounds) and carry
on 17 pounds free, second bag (up to 50 pounds is
75.00USD, can't be prepaid).
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