o [

From: jeffrey E.
Sent: Mon 7/2/2018 11:33:48 AM
Subject: Re: Ticket for France vs Uruguay for -k to purchase?

no

I purchased one ticket for @i ($463.75).. she is asking if | should purchase another one
(see below) Please advise if 1 should. . .if we do, the seat would not be together. . .in order to
get 2 seats together, I must buy 2 new ones at the same time. Buy 2 new ones?

Thank j-,-ml- . Should you get a 2nd one in case I bring one of his girl friend ?

On Jul 1, 2018, at 6:50 PM, jeftrey E. <jcevacation{@gmail.com> wrote:

yes

On Sun, Jul 1, 2018 at 6:22 PN KGN |\ 1otc

Below fl'-:‘.rn- Ok to purchase? Tickets from $400-54000. :

Is 1t possible to get a ticket for the quarter final who's gonna take place in Nym 7 Tt will be
France against Uruguay .

Sent from my iPhone

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-chent privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

EFTA_R1_01040599
EFTA02252251



please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 15 the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

EFTA_R1_01040600
EFTA02252252



