
To: 
From: Bella Klein 
Sent Fri 7/13/2018 3:12:48 PM 
Subject: Re: Hotel Toronto 

Wire sent 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel 

On Jul 12, 2018, at 5:28 PM, wrote: 

Hello, Bella!:) 
How are you? 
I paid the hotel via my debit card.Jeffrey knows. Lesley helped me with booking. Photo of 

final bill attached. 
Can you please refund it to my chase account. 
Let me know please if there are anything I should provide/ help with.. 

Thank you!!! 
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