To: Peggy Siegall
Cc: WH Rich Kah !

From:
Sent: Mon 7/30/2018 8:06:00 PM
Subject: Re: On Behalf of Peggy Siegal

check will be sent today via messenger!

On Jul 30, 2018, at 2:13 PM, Rebecca Drescher I GGG

WIrote:
Sounds great! We are here Monday-Friday from 10am-6pm.

Best,
Rebecca

From:
Sent: Monday, July 30, 2018 1:34 PM
To: Rebecca Drescher

Cc: Joshua Schmell; Rich Kahn
Subject: Re: On Behalf of Peggy Siegal

Jeftrey would like us to make out a check to Peggy Siegal Co for 30K and deliver to her
office:

750 Lexingston, 5th floor
Will advise before bringing over...
On Jul 30, 2018, at 1:10 PM, Rebecca Drescher

- - rotc:

Wonderful, thanks IENEINIE

rrom: [
Sent: Monday, July 30, 2018 1:.07 PM

To: Rebecca Drescher
Cc: Joshua Schmell
Subject: Re: On Behalf of Peggy Siegal

Hi Rebecca. Thanks for the email. Will get back with you,.. -

On Jul 30, 2018, at 12:59 PM., Rebecca Drescher

-
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Peaggy and Jeffrey were talking this weekend, and per everyone's records, it looks
like Jeffrey still wants to give Peggy $30k from last year's
birthday. I'm cc'ing Peggy's business manager on this email
who can arrange with you.

Hope you have a lovely week!

Best,
Rebecca Drescher
Peggv Siegal Co.
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