To:
From:
Sent:
Subject:

HI Bella...we will need to reimburse - for her hotel stay...she had to prepay.

seila iein

Lesley Groff
Sun 7/22/2018 10:54:47 PM

Reimburse for hotel stay

Will send JE approval

Begin forwarded message:

erom: N NN
Subject: Re: Hotel , flight tickets :

Date: July 21, 2018 at 6:29:23 PM EDT
To: Lesley Groff <

=

They will charge me 348%
Receipts are attached

On Saturday, July 21, 2018, 5:28:03 PM EDT, Lesley Groff —: wrote:

Thank

you socoo much !!
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