
To: SW, Travel[t ] 
From: 
Sent: Mon 7/30/2018 4:29:57 PM 
Subject: Re: Value of ticket OWSYSE 

ok got it. thanks 

On Jul 30 2018 at 12:28 PM Natalia Molotkova 
wrote: 

It has to be from US to Europe. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

ours: on t roug nay - EST 

ok, thanks for the info. I will find out what Jeffrey wants to do here. Does the flight have to remain Miami to 
Budapest to Miami? 

On Jul 30, 2018, at 11:12 AM, Natalia Molotkova 

Yes, fee is EUR150.00 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

ok, and what is fee to change? I assume it is a fee plus difference in fare to change. 

> wrote: 

On Jul 30, 2018, at 11:00 AM, Natalia Molotkova > wrote: 

After departure ticket is non-refundable, bit can be changed. Round trip fare was 1312.31. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationshi Mana er 

ours: on t roug nay ST 

Hi Natasha...we have a ticke for Lasma to fly from Miami to Budapest on Aug. 10...Can you tell me what it v 

EFTA_R1_01041874 
EFTA02252815



value? she will not take this flight... 

OWSYSE 

Thanks. Lesley 
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