
To: Bella Klei 
From: 
Sent: Fri 8124/201~ 
Subject: Re: Uber fo 

yes! it is under my `business account' with Jeffrey's card details-you sent me 
the confirm email the other day! 

> on Aug 24, 2018, at 11:08 AM, Bella Klein 

> • Great, do you have JE Amex to pay for it 
> Thank you, 
> Bella 

wrote: 

> • Te : 

» On Aug 24, 2018, at 11:05 AM, wrote: 
>> 
» ok! I have `set up' an Ober for under my `business account' a 
pick up for today at 2pm from 301 to drive her to JFK-575.31!! 
>> 
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