
To: 
From: Bella Klein 
Sent Tue 8/21/2018 5:15:40 PM 
Subject Re: Architects to take Uber? 

I think we should try to negotiate with Carosa as we know them already and after the recent 
incident.. 
Thank you, 
Bella 

On Aug 21, 2018, at 1:12 PM,  wrote: 

Agree. How about Carmel or the 777 7777 company? Do they have nice cars? I don't 
know. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Aug 21, 2018, at 1:04 PM, Bella Klein wrote: 

well. let say 80, round trip 160 , still not 216.. 
Thank you, 
Bella 

On Au 21, 2018, at 12:52 PM 
wrote: 

Ok. I just did a pretend trip and it is quoting $58. That is cheap! It could 
always be more due to traffic or a surge come Saturday. 
Never really know for sure 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Aug 21, 2018, at 12:45 PM, Bella Klein wrote: 

please try to enter address in the app but 
don't order. It will give you choices.. 
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Thank you, 
Bella 

On Aug 21, 2018, at 12:44 PM, 

wrote: 

I really do not know how much Uber would cost from JFK to 
JE's house. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Aug 21, 2018, at 9:15 AM, Bella Klein 
ailla wrote: 

Maybe we should 
beat them down on 
rates. What would 
Uber charge for 
same ride 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On Aug 21, 2018, at 7:30 AM,IMIMIII 

on> wrote: 

Here 
you 
go. Do 
I hire 
CARos 
a? Or 
please 
advise 

Sent from my iPhone 
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Begin forwarded message: 

From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Date: Au st 21 2018 at 7:12:29 AM EDT 
To 
Subject: Re: Architects to take Uber? 

car service 

On Tue Au 21 2018 at 7:09 AM, 
wrote: 

Should the architects take Uber to your house 
this Sat. Aug. 25th? (tell them we will 
reimburse) 

please note 
The information contained in this 
communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, 
may 
constitute inside information, and is intended 
only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of 
this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly 
prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us 
immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies 
thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights 
reserved 
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