
To: Lesley Groff[lesley.jeeegmaitcomJ 
From: Jeffrey E. 
Sent Mon 8/20/201 • • 
Subject: Re: Ticket for 

deepak on wed. ? woody for dinner thurs. ? Icon? is patrick back? . . ask if bamaby is around 
9 

On Mon, Aug 20, 2018 at 9:29 AM, Lesley Groff ‹ > wrote: 

Airchase refundable fare at $1724.60 for 

Direct: 

I SU 
2 SU 

260 OISEP SVO NRT 0700P I035A 
261 30SEP NRT SVO 1200N 0405P 

TOTAL FARE - USD 1473.60 (refundable 
$1724.60). 

Sent from my iPhone 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationegmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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