
To: Bella Klein 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent: Tue 8/7/2018 1:53:03 PM 
Subject: Re: Life Hotel-Jeffrey Epstein 

good word. Wish I didnt have to use it though! 

On Aug 7, 2018, at 9:52 AM, Bella Klein e > wrote: 

i learned a new word "nuisance":)) 
Thank you, 
Bella 

On Aug 7, 2018, at 9:50 AM, Lesley Groff e > 
wrote: 

Good morning to all! Incredibly, now they both must check OUT on Sat Aug. 
11th! so sorry for the nuisance! 

On Aue 6, 2018 at 8:56 PM, Jaymes Nguyen 
wrote: 

Hi Lesley, 

I have reinstated Toma's reservation and modified to come in on the 8th. 

I have modified both ands check out date to be 
on the 12th. 

Payment have been applied to both accordingly. 

Have a great night. 

Regards, 

Jaymes Nguyen 
Front Office Manager 

<0A4D067D9E884CBB9F4FCF7789E627A0[20725045).png> 

19 West 31. Street 
New York, NY 10001 
T: 

F.
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E: 
W: lifenotei corn 

From: James Bryant 

Sent: Monday, August 6, 2018 8:40:08 PM 
To: Lesley Groff 

Cc: Bella Klein; Jaymes Nguyen 

Subject: Re: Life Hotel-Jeffrey Epstein 

Copying in Jaymes, our Front Office Manager, who can make the 
changes for us. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Aug 6, 2018, at 8:20 PM, Lesley Groff wrote: 

Hello James...I am sorry to bother you but is 
now available to come to NY! Therefore. I would like 
to book her a kiuSd room again (close to 
possible) BUT, arrive on Wed. Aug. 8th 

still arrives tomorrow. Aug. 7. They will both 
now stay until Sunday Aug. 12th! May we extend 
their stay until Sunday Aug. 12th with late check out? 

Lesley 

On Aug 6, 2018, at 12:03 PM, Bella 
Klein wrote: 

Great, Thank you! 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On Aug 6, 2018, at 
12:01 PM, James 

> wrote: 

Hi Bella, 

I have received our 

email and 

reservation has been 
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cancelled. Payment 
for-
reservation has been 
applied. We will 
send you a final folio 
on her check-out 
day. 

Regards, 

James 

From: Bella Klein 

Sent: Monday, August 6, 2018 11:59 AM 
To: James Bryant < 
Subject: Re: Life Hotel-Jeffrey Epstein 

James, 
Please confirm 
receipt of my email. 
Thank you, 

Bella 

On Aug 
6, 2018, 
at 
11:18 
AM, 
Bella 
Klein 

wrote: 

Hello 
James, 
Please 
cancel 
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reserva 
tion for 

Credit 
card 
authori 
zation 
form is 
attache 
d. 
Please 
email 
receipt 
when 
availabl 
e. Feel 
free to 
contact 
with 
any 
questio 
n 

Thank 
you, 

Bella 

On Aug 6, 2018, at 9:46 AM, Lesley Groff 
wrote: 

Thank you! YES king beds would be super. If the 
rooms could be close together that would be 
tremendous too! Lesley 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Aug 6, 2018, at 9:02 AM, David Mitchell 
wrote: 

James please meet Lesley 
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Please give them my rate for both of these 
rooms 

James is our Hotel manager 

Lesley now that it is two rooms , shall we 
do King beds 

James please upgrade as well to VIP at no 
extra charge 

DAVID MITCHELL 

Mitchell Holdings LLC 
745 Fifth Avenue 
New York NY 10151 
USA 

On Aug 6, 2018, at 9:00 AM, Lesley Groff 
>. wrote: 

David, Jeffrey is asking for 2 rooms 
and we will pay! The second room 
is for Who 
do I give CC details to? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Aug 6, 2018, at 8:08 AM, David 
Mitchell 

wrote: 

is this a comp 

DAVID MITCHELL 

Mitchell Holdings LLC 
745 Fifth Avenue 
New York NY 10151 
USA 
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On Aug 6, 2018, at 8:03 AM, 
Lesley Groff 

wrote: 

Thank you! Two 
queen beds perfect. 
Name is 

Please send confirm 
once you have it so I 
may pass along to her. 
Really appreciate it. 
Lesley 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Aug 5, 2018, at 
11:54 PM, David 
Mitchell 

wrote: 

Sure 

Name 

Two queens or 
one king 

DAVID 
MITCHELL 

Mitchell 
Holdings LLC 
745 Fifth 
Avenue 
New York NY 
10151 
USA 

On Aug 5, 2018, 
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at 10:31 PM, 
Lesley Groff 

wrote: 

Hi David! 
Hope 
you are 
well. 
Would it 
be 
possible 
to get 
one 
room at 
the life 
hotel for 
2 of 
Jeffreys 
friends 
Tuesday 
Aug 7-
Friday 
Aug 10 
(with 
late 
checkout 
on Aug 
10). ?? 
4> lesley. 

Sent 
from my 
iPhone 
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