To:

From: Matalia Molotkova

Sent: Tue 8/7/2018 2:10:44 PM
Subject: Flights for and her sisiter

Title: American Express ®

| found RL WIPXVA, ticket is no longer open, looks like it was used. It was Air France ticket JFK-
CDG |, exchanged to January 17 2018 travel date,

So, it will be straight ticket, is it still OK?

Regards,

Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

unfortunatley, | do not...

On Aug 7, 2018, at 9:57 AM, Natalia Molotkova <[} G-

wrote:

OK, we have to use credit from Paris, WIPXVA. By any chance, do you have ticket number on
that?

Regards,

Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Please issue changeable fare Option 2 departing CDG at 10:20am and return at 5:48pm on
24th. . thanks!

On Aug 7, 2018, at 9:23 AM, Natalia Molotkova {_:*

wrote:
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let me ask [ directy..

On Aug 7, 2018, at 9:23 AM, Natalia Molotkova <_

wrote:

Changeable fare is $1491.31.

We can do couple options as a time frame:
DL1019 15AUG CDG JFK  450P T15P
DL1017 24AUG JFK CDG 1125P 1255P
Both flights operated by Air France.

DL 405 15AUG CDG JFK 1020A 1252P
DL 404 24AUG JFK CDG 546P 720A
Which option will work?

Regards,

Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

OK, on it
Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Morning! We want to purchase the Delta flights but we must be able to change them. - will
probably stay longer. Please DO use any credit we have for her on Delta! | show a crediton a
ticket for Paris to NY, must rebook before Nov. 17, 2018. Delta Rec. Loc
WIPXVA. | also have saved; locator is GRETJX. Credit will expire November 4

2018. $628.26 Delta. JFK to CDG. Let me know!

Sent from my iPhone
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On Aug 6, 2018, at 5:29 PM, Natalia Molotkova <[ G- <t

girthday is [ N

Sent from my iPhone

On Aug 6, 2018, at 5:17 PM, Natalia Molotkova <_:> wrote:

Delta is non changeable. | can make it changeable, just at a higher fare. XL AIRWAYS FRANCE
is non-refundable, change fee is 130.00EUR.

Regards,

Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager
Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

| can get for you.
Those are non refundable but changeable? What is refundable 7

Sent from my iPhone

On Aug 6, 2018, at 5:17 PM, Natalia Molotkova <[ G- -t

| can't view her date of birth any Iunger.-
SE 30 15AUG CDG JFK 0725P 0945F
SE 51 24AUG JFK CDG 1155P 0100F
$961.11 per ticket.

Delta

DL 405 15AUG CDG JFK 1020A 1252FP
DL 404 24AUG JFK CDG 0546P 0720A
$1405.11 (i} | think has credit with Delta).

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager
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Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Sent from my iPhone

On Aug 6, 2018, at 4:54 PM, Natalia Molotkova <[ G- -t

What is her sister's name?
Regards,
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager
Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

?

Sent from my iPhone

On Aug 6, 2018, at 4:48 PM, Natalia Molotkova <|| G -t

On it.
Regards,
Matalia (Natasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager
Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Hi Natasha. We need below flights for [JJlj and her sister. Do you still have her sisters details?
| may have copy of passport but will need to sift through a lot of emails.
Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:
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erom: I
Date: Auiust 6, 2018 at 4:16:

To
Subject: Fly Paris nyc

Hey Lesley , how are you? Can you organize for me and my sister a ticket to come to
nyc on the 15th of August and comeback in Paris the 24th ? | might stay longer but in
case for the custom better to have a return ticket . Thank you .

Envoyé de mon iPhone
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