
To: Natalia Molotkova[natalia.molotkova@centurion.com] 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent: Thur 8/23/2018 3:06:53 PM 
Subject: Re: Cancel flights fob today Miami-NY 

Thanks! 

Sent from my iPhonc 

On Aug 23, 2018, at 11:06 AM, Natalia Molotkova ‹ > wrote: 

yes. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Each? 

Sent from my iPhone 

Value approximately 430.00USD. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Oops on RL! Sorry. Thanks for letting me know about credit. Let me know for how much 
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once it processes. Thanks 

Sent from my iPhone 

Ok, I cancelled it. Ticket was non refundable, so now credit for future use. Record locator is 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

We need to cancel flights today f on Miami to NY. They are now flying 
with Jeffrey on his private plane. Rec. loc. 

Sent from my iPhone 
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