To: Amex Centurian Travel[natalia.molotkova@centurion.com]
From:
Sent: Tue 8/14/2018 9:49:16 PM

Subject: Re: Tickets for Ann Rodriquez and _

excellent! please issue these tickets. ..

On Aug 14, 2018, at 5:43 PM, Natalia Molotkova

<nataha.molotkova@centurion.com> wrote:

Emery

AA 943 19AUG STT MIA 0219P 0520P
TOTAL FARE - USD 215.96
Ann

1 AA 943 19AUG STT MIA 0219P 0520P
2 AA 1391 24AUG MIA STT 1219P 0301P

TOTAL FARE - USD  427.986

Regards,

Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

natalia. molotkova@centurion.com

(877) B77-0987

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

thanks...and you saw we need to purchase the biz seats for the 2 architects (xavier and Kifah)

On it.

Regards,

Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

natalia. molotkova@centurion.com

(877) 877-0987

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Hi Natasha...we need the below tickets for Ann and Emery, coach seats (Mom, Ann, is dropping off her dau
way for Emery):

EFTA_R1_01043931
EFTA02253725



From: STT-MIA

AAHD43

Departing: Aug 19th, 2018

Departing time from STT: 2:19pm arrive Miami 5:20pm
Passengers: Ann Rodriquez & Emery Poleon

American Airlines#?7?

From: MIA-STT

Departing: Aug 24th, 2018
Departing time from MIA: 12:19pm
Passenger: Ann Rodriquez

Emery Poleon:
Ann Rodrique

Pricing please”
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