To:  Natalia Molotkoval | -

From: Lesley Groff
Sent; Mon 9/10/2018 5:47:56 PM
Subject: Re: Cancel Rec. Loc#ZZBXNV

Will come back to you.

Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 10, 2018, at 1:42 PM, Natalia Molotkova _n- wrote:

It is non-refundable ticket. If we cancel, full loss - $794.38. If we re-book different dates -
change fee EUR 70.00 plus possible difference in fare. Let me know what to do.

Regards,
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager
Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Please Cancel ||} I ticket. . .she will not make the trip..Rec. Loc#ZZBXNV
do we get anything for cancelling? or complete loss?
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