
To: 
From: 

Lesley Gr f 

Sent 
Subject Re: Ticket for -does she have/need Visa? 

Mon 8/20/2018 4:21:02 PM 

Thank you Lesley 

Envoye de mon iPhone 

Le 20 twat 2018 a 12:15, Lesley Groff •c > a Cent : 

oh wow! OK...ticket was purchased and sent to her! 

On Au 20 2018 at 11:46 AM, 
wrote: 

She need a visa . This is why she need a ticket . I might go with her 

Envoye de mon iPhone 

Le 20 emit 2018 a 09:37, Lesley Groff < > a ecrit : 

Hi Please sec below from Jeffre . He is asking me 
to purchase a ticket for Moscow-
tokyo-Moscow. Does she have or need a visa for this 
trip? 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "jeffrey E." 
leevacationOgmail.com>

Date: August 20, 2018 at 9:31:27 AM EDT 
To: Lesley Groff 
Subject: Re: Ticket for 

ok and ask re hr visa if she needds 

On Mon, Aug 20, 2018 at 9:29 AM, Lesle Groff 
wrote: 

I will purchase refundable fare at $1724.60 for 

EFTA_R1_01046559 

EFTA02254606



Direct: 

I SU 
2 SU 

260 01 SEP SVO NRT 0700P 1035A 
261 30SEP NRT SVO 1200N 0405P 

TOTAL FARE - USD 1473.60 (refundable 
S1724.60). 

Sent from my iPhone 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jcevacationegmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

EFTA_R1_01046560 

EFTA02254607


