
To: 
From: Lesley ro 
Sent: Thur 9/6/2018 4:06:37 PM 
Subject: Re: You sent the tickets to the girls correct? 

Agree. I actually already changed her ticket to Nov 12-15. We can change again 
for $41 US 

Sent from my iPhone 

> On Sep 6, 2018, at 10:55 AM, > wrote: 

> If she get her visa sure . I think he 11 come in Paris in November . He comes 
every 1 month and half 

> Envoy6 de mon iPhone 

>> Le 6 sept. 2018 A 15:25, Lesley Groff a ecrit : 

, do you think we will be rebooking her a ticket at some point? If I 
cancel we completely lose our money. If I rebook now for a different date I can 
use the money for that ticket. 
> > 
» Sent from my iPhone 

>» On Sep 6, 2018, at 8:55 AM, > wrote: 
>» 
>» Can you cancel please ? 
>> >
>» Envoy6 de mon iPhone 

>>>> Le 6 sept. 2018 A 01:41, Lesley Groff a ecrit : 
>>» 
>>» Ok sounds good. However jeffrey wishes to Handle it. Thank you! 
>>» 
>>>> Sent from my iPhone 
>>» 
>>>>> On Sep 5, 2018, at 7:38 PM, > wrote: 
>>>» 
>»» I send to the first two 
>>>>> 
>»» Envoy6 de mon iPhone 
>>>» 
>>>>» Le 6 sept. 2018 A 00:36, Lesley Groff < > a ecrit : 
>>>>>> 
>>»» Hi . You sent all the girls their tickets, correct? I did not send 
to anyone. Only to you, Jeffrey and Valdson. I don't even have their email 
addresses. 
>>>>» 
>>>>>> Sent from my iPhone 
>>>» 
>» 
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