
To: Amex Centurian Travel 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent: Tue 8/7/2018 3:53:49 PM 
Subject: Re: CHANGe return date to Sat Aug 11th-PENKAUSKAITEJT OMA PUTBDE 

Please issue below new flights for Toma. 

On Aug 7, 2018, at 11:51 AM, Natalia Molotkova 
wrote: 

Your response is required to complete this reservation. Prices and availability are subject to change. 

• Total air reservation, including taxes and fees: $1997.81. 

• Ticket is non-refundable, EUR35.00 change penalty applies plus difference in fare. 

• Wed 08 Aug - Aeroflot 2105 - Economy - 1h 30m 
Departing: Vilnius International Airport, (VNO) at 11.10am 
Arriving: Moscow Sheremetyevo Airport, (SVO) at 12.40pm 

Wed 08 Aug - Aeroflot 102 - Economy - 9h 55m 
Departing: Moscow Sheremetyevo Airport, (SVO) at 2.25pm 
Arriving: New York John F Kennedy Airport, (JFK) at 5.20pm 

• Sat 11 Aug - Aeroflot 101 - Economy - 9h Om 
Departing: New York John F Kennedy Airport, (JFK) at 2.25pm 
Arriving: Moscow Sheremetyevo Airport, (SVO) at 6.25am 

Sun 12 Aug - Aeroflot 2104 - Economy - 1h 40m 
Departing: Moscow Sheremetyevo Airport, (SVO) at 8.35am 
Arriving: Vilnius International Airport, (VNO) at 10.15am 

Please reply to this email and provide your authorization to proceed. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

lets do this new flight on Aeroflot....Toma specifically requested to depart on the 11am flight on 8th...this woi 

On Aug 7, 2018, at 10:35 AM, Natalia Molotkova rote: 

I am afraid we can't issue outbound as one way, flight is sold out , I need to cancel and re-book. I can take a 
re-book that. 
I can offer Aeroflot 
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1 SU 
1 SU 

2 SU 
2 SU 

2105 08AUG VNO SVO 1110A 1240P 
102 08AUG SVO JFK 0225P 0520P 

101 11AUG JFK SVO 0225P 0625A 
2104 12AUG SVO VNO 0835A 1015A 

TOTAL FARE - USD 1997.81 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

EST 

what happens if we do as 2 tickets? outbound on Fin Air that we have current) and the return on KLM? too 

On Aug 7, 2018, at 9:54 AM, Natalia Molotkova wrote: 

I made mistake, instead of 11 August, put in availability entry 1 August. Sorry. I was right first time, o 
in esinki. 
AY 6 JFK HEL 540P 850A 
AY/N7 1105 HEL VNO 430P 615P 
And no combinable fares. 
I can offer 
KLM 
1 KL /BT 2844 08AUG VNO AMS 0805A 0935A 
OPERATED BY AIR BALTIC CORPORATION SIA 
1 KL 641 08AUG AMS JFK 0125P 0340P 

2 KL 646 11AUG JFK AMS 0630P 0750A 
2 KL /BT 2845 12AUG AMS VNO 1020A 0140P 
OPERATED BY AIR BALTIC CORPORATION SIA 

TOTAL FARE - USD 1930.41 
Or Ukranian Airlines: 
1 PS 184 08AUG VNO KBP 0705A 0825A 
1 PS 231 08AUG KBP JFK 0620P 0905P 

2 PS 
2 PS 

232 11AUG JFK KBP 1230A 0420P 
183 11AUG KBP VNO 0735P 0855P 

TOTAL FARE - USD 1263.81 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationshi. Manaser 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 
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Please issue below ticket for Toma! 

On Aug 7, 2018, at 9:30 AM, Natalia Molotkova 

We can do different Finair flight: 
1 AY /N7 1102 08AUG VNO HEL 1145A 0125P 
OPERATED BY NORDIC REGIONAL AIRLINES 
1 AY 5 08AUG HEL JFK 0210P 0350P 

2 AY 6 01AUG JFK HEL 0355P 0700A 
2 AY /N7 1107 02AUG HEL VNO 1130A 0110P 
OPERATED BY NORDIC REGIONAL AIRLINES 

TOTAL FARE - USD 1343.21 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

bummer...ok,...thanks. Let me know whats out there 

wrote: 

On Aug 7, 2018, at 9:19 AM, Natalia Molotkova wrote: 

Yes, we can, but Finair doesn't have nice connection on August 11th, let me check other options. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Morning. I called last night and spoke to your colleague to book this ticket but already need to change it. Jeffi 
Both leave NY on Saturday Aug 11th. If you can do the same flights they already have Sunday but change to 
booked this ticket last night can we void and Re book? Lesley 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "American Express Travel" 
Date: August 6, 2018 at 10:16:31 PM ED 
To: 
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Subject: Invoice 836470 for PENKAUSKAITE/TOMA PUTBDE 

DO NOT REPLY TO THIS EMAIL. This message was sent from a notification only address that cannc 
messages. If you have any questions, please contact Centurion Travel Service at 1-877-877-0987. 

If airline tickets are purchased for this itinerary: 
Airline Baggage Fee/Rules may apply and can be accessed by visiting: 
https://myamextravel.com/baqqacie 

Your travel arrangements are outlined below in the email. Please refer to the PDF attachment and itin 
regarding your travel arrangements. Your Centurion Travel Service travel plans have been posted to 
click on the link to view your trip details and add link to your bookmarked favorites for easy access in t 

American Express Travel PUTBDE 
Record Locator 

Entry and Exit Information for Travel 

American Express strongly recommends that you periodically review www.Visacentral.comfamex for the mo 
entry/exit requirements for your travel destination. Due to frequent changes, American Express cannot guara 
information provided and expressly disclaims any liability for any inaccurate or incomplete information contai 

You may receive customer service emails even if you have requested not to receive email marketing offers f 
about our e-mail practices, please review the American Express Privacy Statement at www.americanexpres 

See attached itinerary PDF or link for full terms and conditions. 

PDF itinerary attachment: 
If you are unable to view the PDF attachment, ensure you have Adobe Acrobat Reader. Refer to website bel. 
software. 

http://www.adobe.com/products/acrobat/readstep.html 

Thank you for choosing American Express Centurion Travel Service and have a pleasant trip. 

Please be advised that certain mandatory hotel-imposed charges, including, but not limited to, daily resort or 
your stay and payable to the hotel operator at check-out from the property. You may wish to inquire with the 
existence and amount of such charges. 

Liability Statement. American Express Travel Related Services Company, Inc. and its parent, subsidiaries, e 
(collectively, "Amex") act as an agent for travel suppliers and you understand and agree that Amex shall not 
expense or damage to persons or property resulting, directly or indirectly, from (1) the acts of omissions of tr 
limited to delays, overbooking's, cancellation of services, cessation of operations, accidents or failures of eqt 
itineraries or schedules; or (2) acts of God, fires, earthquakes, floods, climatic aberrations, acts of governme 
riots, theft, disease, accidents or failures related to the public internet, telecommunications lines or facilities, 
or any other cause beyond the control of Amex. 
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Intermediary Disclosure. Amex assists you in finding travel suppliers and making arrangements that meet yo 
various factors in identifying travel suppliers to you and recommending specific itineraries. In this role, we an 
party and not as a fiduciary. We want you to be aware that certain suppliers pay us commissions as well as i 
targets or other goals, and from time to time may also provide incentives to our travel counselors. Certain st 
compensation to us for various marketing and administrative services that we perform for them, such as gra 
channels, participating in marketing programs and supporting technology initiatives. In addition, we receive c 
customers use the American Express Card or other American Express products to pay for supplier products 
we may enter into other business relationships with suppliers and these arrangements, including levels and 
incentives we receive, are subject to change. In identifying suppliers and recommending itineraries, we may 
including supplier availability and your preferences. The relationships we have with suppliers may also influl 
the itineraries we recommend. 

California State Seller of Travel Registration Number: 1022318. Washington State Seller of Travel Registrati. 
TA# 669 Registered Iowa Travel Agency. 

To learn more about eimail security or report a suspicious e•rmail, please visit us at . • , • • 
EP 2015 American Express. All rights reserved 
American Express uses 3rd party concierge service providers ivho are not authorized to act on behalf of American Express and you acknowledge that Amer 
Express is in no way responsible or liable for the actions of the service provider and the only remedy for any claims relating to services or products provided 
service provider is against the service provider and not against American Express. You are responsible for any purchases, shipping charges andlor fees you 
authorize. We reserve the right to note profile and preference data for servicing purposes. 
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