
To: 
From: ill 
Sent Tue 018 5:58:42 PM 
Subject: Re: 

Ok thank you 

Envoyé de mon iPhone 

Le II sept. 2018 à 19:38, Lesley Groff O> a écrit : 

I am issuing the below for 
LO 331 13SEP WAW CDG 725A 955A - $393.60 

B2 866 14SEP CDG MSQ 1115A 315P - $210.90 

On Se 11 2018 at 12:27 PM, 
wrote: 

But you can take the round trip Warsaw 

Envoyé de mon iPhone 

Le I I sept. 2018 à 18:13, Lesley Groff O> a écrit : 

Does she also fly back to Warsaw? Round trip Warsaw? 
Or is Minsk the return? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Sep 11, 2018, at 11:04 AM, 
wrote: 

She needs to fly from Warsaw 

Envoyé de mon iPhone 

Le II sept. 2018 à 16:48, Lesley Groff -O> a 
écrit : 

Hi Please see below. I 
can't get a Flight through 
Warsaw early on Thursday. Can 

EFTA_R1_01049007 

EFTA02256021



fly on the direct flights I 
found? 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "jeffrey E." 
leevacation@gmai 
Ircom> 

Date: September 11 2018 at 10:45:28 AM EDT 
To: Lesley Groff 
Subject: Re: 

we can try ask 

On Tue, Sep 11, 2018 at 4:29 PM, Lesley Groff 

om> wrote: 

no flights on 
Thursday morning 
through 
Minsk...can she 
fly direct instead? 
Belavia Air 

B2 865 13SEP 
MSQ CDG 825A 
1025A 

82 864 14SEP CDG MSQ 540P 940P 

S691.00 

On 
Sep 
11, 
2018, 
at 
7:46 
AM, 
jeffrey 
E. 
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cation 
@gma 
il.com 
> 
wrote: 

not sure yet lets look at fligth from minsk throu 
warsa 
w 
thurs 
morni 
ng 
return 
ti 
minsk 
fri 
aflern 
non. 

On Tue, Sep 11, 2018 at 1:44 PM, Lesley Groff 

Did r 
get 
her 
Visa? 
Do 

we 
need 
to 
book 
her a 
ticket 
9 

Sent from my iPhone 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only 

for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly 

prohib 
ited 

and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us 

imme 
diately 
by 

return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevac 
ation 
@gma 
il.com 
,and 

destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights 

resery 
ed 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationegmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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