
To: 
From: 
Sent Thur 9/6/2018 7:16:25
Subject: Re: Ticket change for 

Lesley Groff 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Sep 6, 2018, at 2:02 PM, wrote: 

That's great, thank you so much Les!! :))) 

On Thu, Sep 6, 2018 at 9:55 AM Lesley Groff < › wrote: 

Hi ....I am actually now purchasing your flight to depart on 20th as the price 
drop was for 20th not 19th...I"m sure that is ok with you!! :) As soon as I have 
your new ticket I will send to you. 

On Se 5 2018 at 8:33 PM, 
wrote: 

You are correct A 19th!! but i would have chosen the cheaper anyway ;) 
Thank you Les!! I appreciate this s000 much!! 
Sent from my iPhone 

On Sep 5, 2018, at 7:30 PM, Lesley Groff cz > wrote: 

■!! I know what your answer will be! But see below 
and reply back to me!! 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "jeffrey E." 
leevacation@amail.com>

Date: September 5 2018 at 7:23:53 PM EDT 
To: Lesley Groff 
Subject: Re: Ticket change for 

ask her 
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On Wed, Sep 5, 2018 at 5:44 PM Lesley Groff 
wrote: 

If we change ticket to depart a week 
from 10th, on 17th it will cost $978 to do 
so. It would be only $278 to change her 
ticket 2 days later to 19th. Please advise if 
I should change her ticket to London to 
the 17th or 19th. Thanks 

Sent from my iPhone 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationAgmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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