
To: 
Fran: Lesley Gr 
Sent Wedr018 3:45:00 PM 
Subject Re 

booked the below for  In July. See ticket below: 

ELE TICKET 
INV S PNIZ 
MT ISSUED:2 LTUL18 PCC:Z8B0 IATA:03531500 
NAM 
FOP: 
CPN A/L FLT CLS DATE BRDOFF TIME ST F/B STAT 
I PS 9263 L 22JUL KBPCDG 245P OK L2SUP I USED 
2 PS 128 D 25JUL CDGKBP 200P OK D2UP I USED 

FARE USD748.00 TAX 22.00YQ TAX 24.00YR TAX 4.00UA 
TAX 13.00YK TAX 23.90FR TAX 33.I0QX 
TAX 52.40IZ 

TOTAL USD920.40 
Regards, 

Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Sep 12, 2018, at 11:35 AM, st > wrote: 

Probably . Thank you Lesley 

Envoye de mon iPhone 

Le 12 sept. 2018 a 17:21, Lesley Groff < c> a 
&tit : 

I will research. I dont recall her until this trip. I will need to dig back 
in my records. Is it possible or Bella could have 
coordinated her ticket when I was out of town? That is what I think. 
III be in touch. 

Sent from my iPhone 

EFTA_R1_01051076 
EFTA02257424



On Se 12 2018 at 10:42 AM, 
wrote: 

He Sley , do you remember how we send 
ticket last time she came to Paris ? 

Envoye de mon iPhone 

EFTA_R1_01051077 
EFTA02257425


