o N
From: Bella Klein
Sent: Thur 9/27/2018 8:32:01 PM

Subject: Re: Receipt - Dr. Paduch

Please send to medicare as well as UHC
Thank you,
Bella

On Sep 27, 2018, at 4:31 Ph-L—!.-'mtc:

we had been told the test would be expensive. 1 am sending to United Healthcare.. i also
forwarded receipt to JE..

On Sep 27, 2018, at 4:29 PM, Bella Kicin ||| N

wrote:
Hope JE 15 aware of the charge..

Thank you,
Bella

Begin forwarded message:

From: Crismely Ovalle

!U!jECt: !ECEIPI‘ - !I". !E!UC“

Date: September 27. 2018 at 3:29:43 PM EDT
To

copelten
Good aﬁernaon-

| apologize for the delay. Attached is invoice along with
payment receipt for Dr. Paduch’s visit on 9/26.

Thank you,
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Cris Qvalle
Weill Cornell Medicine
Department of Uralogy

Llepart
525 East 68" Street, Stamr 9244
Mew York, New York 100€
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