
To: Richard Kahn[ 
Cc: Lesley Groff[e 
Epsteinlleevacation©g maiI.corn] 
From: 
Sent Mon 9/17/2018 1:32:16 PM 
Subject Re: Payment for month 

J; Jeffrey 

Hello Rich, 
Can you please make payment for the apartment in the Air BnB link below as requested by 
Jeffrey. 
The dates of the reservation are 09/21/2018 - 10/21/2018. 

https://www.airbnb.com/rooms/21528451?location=Sloanc%20Square%2C%20London%2C%20 
United%20Kingdom&adults=l&children=0&infants &guests=l&check in=2018-09-
21&check out=2018- I 0-21&s=N9nk2Fx-

Thank you very much and kindest regards, 

On Mon, Sep 17, 2018 at 7:18 AM jeffrey E. leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

rich directly 

On Sun, Sep 16, 2018 at 9:05 PM, wrote: 

Dear Jeffrey, I am doing the booking for Nell Gwynn in London, should I put it on my visa 
and send the receipts to Bella or is it better for you for her to put the amount on my Amex 
and I do it from that? 

Thank you xxxxx 

Sent from my iPhone 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
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