To: Bella Kiein NN
From: Lesley Groff
Sent: Tue 10/23/2018 8:41:25 PM

Subject: Fwd: Leasing agreement

Begin forwarded message:

From: J <jeevacation@gmail.com=>
Subject: Re: Leasing agreement
Date: October 23, 2018 at 4:37:32 PM EDT

To: Lesley Groff <G -

yes

On Tue, Oct 23, 2018 at 4:30 PM Lesley Gmﬁ"_* wrote:

OK ftor Bella to pay for -H apartment in Hong Kong?

Begin forwarded message:

From: Bella Klein G-
Subject: Fwd: Leasing agreement

Date: October 23, 2018 at 3:58:29 PM EDT
To: Lesley Groff <

Hi Les,

Do you have JE approval for Illll apartment in Hong Kong. Cost 2,654.08
Thank you,

Bella

re!

Begin forwarded message:

rrom:

Subject: Fwd: Leasing agreement
Date: October 23, 2018 at 1:07:15 PM EDT

To: beliion

Hello, Bella! @+

EFTA_R1_01057608
EFTA02260503



Here are the bank details to make a payment for my apartment at Hong Kong.

The price is in Hong Kong dollars .

The lessor asked me to send Bank shp , once wire 1s done.

20800 hkd - 13800 rent price + 7000 deposit.

Account Name: [ GGG

BANK OF CHINAi HONG KONG) LIMITED

SWIFT code: NG
Branch Address: 1 Garden Road, Hong Kong

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-chent privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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