
To: Bella Klein 
Cc: Lesley Groff[
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent Mon 10/22/2018 7:17:07 PM 
Subject Re: Hotel in nyc 

no need to add further fuel.. 
i will deduct from end of year expenses.. 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell

On Oct 22, 2018, at 2:17 PM, Bella Klein wrote: 

I would ask to reimburse for 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

hotel stay.. Rich, please advise 

On Oct 22, 2018, at 2:15 PM, Lesley Groff 
wrote: 

you're kidding right? I'm ALL OVER THEM! it is terrible! I want an 
exterminator every 2 weeks...Anthony and Andrew are 
aware...Jeffrey is not happy either 

On Oct 22, 2018, at 2:14 PM, Bella Klein 

'c .= > wrote: 

Did we notify building management? 
Thank you, 
Bella 
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Tel: 

On Oct 22, 2018, at 2:12 PM, Lesley Groff 
aa. wrote: 

yes...she could not stay in our apartment because it was infested with 
roaches. gross...she moved to a hotel. 
'du ity knows. 

On Oct 22, 2018, at 2:08 PM, 
Bella Klein 
<SIllt wrote: 

Les, 
do you know anything about it? 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Id iikslimun m 
Tel: 

Begin forwarded 
message: 

From: 

Subject: Hotel in 
nyc 
Date: October 
22, 2018 at 
2:05:42 PM EDT 
To: 

Hey Bella , can you please reimburse me this invoice 
because I had to 
stay in a hotel on 
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Friday night. 
Thank you 

<Folio-A-Attachment.pdf> 

Envoye de mon iPhone 
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