
To: Bella Klein 
From: 
Sent Fri 9/28/2018 6:07:23 PM 
Subject: Re: Receipt - Dr. Paduch 

yes, sent yesterday via snail mail 

On Sep 28, 2018, at 2:02 PM, Bella Klein a wrote: 

Not sure at all. Lets send to United health care. I will do a little research, but don't think it 
is possible.. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On Sep 28, 2018, at 1:54 PM, > 
wrote: 

arc you sure I am to send the receipt to Medicare? I can't find an address to send 
to? 

On Se 27, 2018 at 4:32 PM, Bella Klein 
wrote: 

Please send to medicare as well as UHC 
Thank you, 
Bella 

On Se 27 2018 at 4:31 PM, 
wrote: 

we had been told the test would be expensive. I am sending to United 
Healthcare...i also forwarded receipt to JE.. 

On Sep 27, 2018, at 4:29 PM, 
Bella Klein 

wrote:

Hope JE is aware of the charge.. 
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Thank you, 
Bella 

Begin forwarded 
message: 

From: Crismely 

IS 
Subject: Receipt -
Dr. Paduch 
Date: September 
27, 2018 at 
3:29:43 PM EDT 
To: 

Cc: Bella Klein 

iirernoon 

I apologize for the 
delay. Attached is 
invoice along with 
payment receipt for 
Dr. Paduch's visit on 
9/26. 

Thank you, 

Cris Ovalle 
Sr.Medical Secretary 

Weill Cornell 
Medicine 
Department of 
Urology 
525 East 68th Street, 
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Starr 924A 
New York, New York 
10065 
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