
To: 
From: Bella Klein 
Sent Fri 9/28/2018 6:08:39 PM 
Subject Re: Receipt - Dr. Paduch 

ok 
Thank you, 
Bella 

On Sep 28, 2018, at 2:07 PM, wrote: 

yes, sent yesterday via snail mail 

On Sep 28, 2018, at 2:02 PM, Bela Klein <a> 
wrote: 

Not sure at all. Lets send to United health care. I will do a little research, but don't 
think it is possible.. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On Sep 28, 2018, at 1:54 PM, 
wrote: 

are you sure I am to send the receipt to Medicare? I can't find an address to 
send to? 

On Sep 27, 2018, at 4:32 PM, Bela Klein 
wrote: 

Please send to medicare as well as UHC 
Thank you, 
Bella 
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On Sep 27, 2018, at 4:31 PM, 

ote: 

we had been told the test would be expensive. I am sending to 
United Healthcare...1 also 
forwarded receipt to JE.. 

On Sep 27, 2018, at 
4:29 PM, Bella 
Klein 

Hope JE is aware of the charge.. 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Begin 
forwar 
ded 
messag 
e: 

From: 
Crism 
ely 
Ovalle 

Subje 
ct: 
Recei 
pt -
Dr. 
Paduc 
h 
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Date: 
Septe 
mber 
27, 
2018 
at 
3:29:4 
3 PM 
EDT 
To: 

Cc: 
Bella 
Klein 

Good 
afterno 
on 

apologi 
ze for 
the 
delay. 
Attache 
d is 
invoice 
along 
with 
payme 
nt 
receipt 
for Dr. 
Paduch' 
s visit 
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on 
9/26. 

Thank 
you, 

Cris 
Ovalle 
Sr.Medi 
cal 
Secreta 
ry

Weill 
Come 

Medic 
ine 
Depart 
ment of 
Urology 
525 
East 
68th Str 
eet, 
Starr 
924A 
New 
York, 
New 
York 
10065 
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