
To: Deirdre Pale 
From: 
Sent: Thur 11/29/2018 5:15:34 PM 
Subject: Re: kaze footrest 

HI Dcidre. Can you confirm you DID receive the signed invoice from me and have placed the 
order for the 4 footrests? Also, when do you think they will arrive Fekkai Salon? 

On Nov 26, 2018, at 12:03 PM, Deirdre Pale 
wrote: 

Yes. No problem 
Just waiting on signed invoice. 

Deirdre Paley 
Regional Sales & Design ►tepresentative 

7 West 561h
NY. New York 10019 
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From: 
Sent: Monday, November 26 2018 10:34 AM 
To: Deirdre Paley 
Subject: Re: kaze footrest 

Deirdre, when you ship to Fekkai Salon can you please put on the label ATTENtion: 
Patrick Basset? We are concerned the order will get lost in the shuffle of all the other 
packages that get delivered to the salon...or can you send directly to Jeffrey? Just don't 
want them to get lost... 

Jeffrey Epstein 
9 East 71st Street 
NY, NY 10021 
212.750.9895 

Please let me know. 

On Nov 26, 2018, at 9:15 AM, Deirdre Paley 
wrote: 

They will ship to Fekkai! 
And yes received just need a signature on the invoice page one and two 

Deirdre Paley 
Regional Sales & Design Representative 
17 West 56'h
NY, New York 10019 
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From: 
Sent: Monday, November 26, 2018 9:01 AM 
To: Deirdre Paley 
Subject: Re: kaze footrest 

Fantastic!! Thank you so much. Did you receive the CC. Form? Will they 
ship to Fekkao or can you ship to Jeffry's home address? 

9 East 71st Street 
New York, NY 10021 

When do you 'guesstimate' we will receive? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 26, 2018, at 8:50 AM, Deirdre Pale 

Please see attached 

Deirdre Paley 
Regional Sales & Design Representative 
17 West Se 
NY, New York 10°19 
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From 
Sent: Friday, November 23, 2018 10:06 AM 
To: Deirdre Paley 
Subject: Re: kaze oo res 

ote: 

Please order 4 total foot rests...Credit Card Form attached! 
Please confirm back to me :) 

On Nov 21, 2018, at 7:05 PM, Deirdre Paley 
rote: 

So sorry for delay 

Please see attached 
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Deirdre Paley 
Regional Sales & Design Representative 
17 West 56'h
N N • v 
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From 
Sent: Wednesday, November 21, 2018 10:32 AM 
To: Deirdre Paley 
Subject: Re: kaze footrest 

ok drive safe!! 

On Nov 21, 2018, at 10:31 AM, 
Deirdre Pale 

wrote: 

I will have this to you by the end of 
the day I'm driving currently. 

Get Outlook for iOS 

Sent: Wednesday, November 21, 2018 10:31 AM 
To: Deirdre Paley 
Subject: Re: kaze footrest 

good morning! please send me 
corrected invoice when you have a 
moment...hoping soon :) 

On Nov 20, 2018, at 
6:55 PM, Deirdre 
Pale 

Oh no! My cells must 
be messed up! My 
apologies! 
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I will resend! 
Just confirming you 
only need one? I 
have in my messages 
2. 
Your cost is 45$ per 
footrest 

Get Outlook for i05 

Sent: Tuesday, November 20, 2018 5:34 PM 
To: Deirdre Paley 
Cc: Patrick Basset 
Subject: Re: kaze footrest 

Hi Deirdre and thank 
you for attaching the 
sales order. I am 
confused however. 
We wanted 1 foot 
rest....how does the 
total come to 
$804.58? How much 
is one footrest and 
how much is 
shipping? It appears 
one foot rest is 
$45.00 but then the 
total unit price says 
$490.00? What is 

.1100.00 for? 

On Nov 
20, 
2018, at 
5:25 
PM, 
Deirdre 
Paley 
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wrote: 
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Sent: Tuesday, November 20, 2018 5:24:19 PM 

To: Deirdre Paley 

Cc: Patrick Basset 

Subject: Re: kaze footrest 

HI 
Deirdre. 
Can you 
please 
send me 
an email 
with the 
attachme 
nt. 
There is 
nothing 
attached 
here. I 
would 
like to 
see the 
order. 

Thank 

On Nov 20, 2018, at 5:21 PM, Deirdre Paley 
wrote: 

I applied fekkai discount 
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Get Outlook for iOS 

From: Deirdre Pale 

Sent: Tuesday, November 20, 2018 5:21 PM 

To: Patrick Basset 

u• 

Subject: Re: kaze footrest 

Get Outlook for 'Os 

From: Patrick Basset 

Sent: Tuesday, November 20, 2018 4:30:50 PM 

To: Deirdre Paley 

Subject: Re: kaze footrest 

Hello mrs Paley 
When I was at the show room on Friday your colleague told 
me the foot rest was 1085 each ? 
Let me know why such a difference in price . 
Thank you 
Best regards 
Patrick basset . 
Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 20 2018 at 14:55 Deirdre Paley 
wrote: 

PLEASE SEE ATTACHEMENTS AND SIGN 

ALL PAGES. 

BEST, 

Deirdre Paley 
Regional Sales & 
Design Representative 
17 West 56th
NY New York 1 )019 
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Confidentiality Note: This e-mail, and any 
attachment to it, contains privileged and 
confidential information intended only for the use 
of the individual(s) or entity named on the e-mail. 
If the reader of this e-mail is not the intended 
recipient, or the employee or agent responsible for 
delivering it to the intended recipient, you are 
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hereby notified that reading it is strictly prohibited. 
If you have received this e-mail in error, please 
immediately return it to the sender and delete it 
from your system. All messages sent to and from 
our system are automatically archived. Thank you. 

<FEKKAI COVER KAZE.pdf> 

<Credit Card Form.pdf> 

<FEKKAI COVER KAZE.pdf><Credit Card 

Form.pdf> 

<FEKKAI COVER KAZE1.pdf> 
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