
To: 
From: 
Sent Fri 11/30/2018 5:06:40 PM 
Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein 

Hi Lesley! 

received everything, thanks! 
Could you update me with the flights and when I need to be ready? 

On Wed, 28 Nov 2018 at 19:36, Lesley Groff <MM > wrote: 

I will let Jeffrey k ow you arc requesting this. Working on flights and pricing now. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 28, 2018, at 11:30 AM, al > wrote: 

Lesley, may you book a comfort or business class for me? Or shall I discuss it 
with Jeffrey in person? 

On Wed, 28 Nov 2018 at 19:28, Lesley Groff sc > wrote: 

Perfect! Working on ticket now. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 28, 2018, at 11:26 AM, 

Lesley, 
Sure, for me this is the best option(3-15). Thank you 

cp, 28 noa6. 2018 r. a 19:22, Lesley Groff< >: 

Update! Now Jeffrey says you should travel Dec 3-15! Ok? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 28, 2018, at 11:01 AM, 
wrote: 

wrote: 
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Hi Lesley, 
Sure 
Sending you bank details 

MTBank 

Swift : 

Account number : 

Full name: 

Bank Address: 

Any other information we need to provide? 

P.s I'm trying to get a paypal account for her but I'm afraid she will have to 
wait for a verification a few days. 

About NYC, 
I'll be able to travel from dec 2nd 

Thanks! 
Best, 

On Wed, 28 Nov 2018 at 18:46, Lesley Groff sc > wrote: 

Hello . -lefty is req, you please pass 
along the bank details for . Could you please 
do so? 

Also, the dates you can travel to NY.. is it Dec 1-14 or Dec 2-16? 

Thank you, 
Lesley 
Assistant to Jeffrey Epstein 

Sent from my iPhone 
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Best re ards 

Best re ards 
M I 

Best re ards 
M I 

Best re ards 
= 
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