To:
From:
Sent:

e - [

Fri 11/16/2018 9:19:19 PM

Subject: Re: Ticket for Matalya Litvinova

Ok thank you!

Sent from my iPhone

On Nov 16, 2018, at 4:02 PM, Natalia Molotkova — wrote:

Yes, | am getting it ready, sorry for delay.

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

HI again...we want to issue option 1 ...can you send me the blurb?. ..

1 KC 894 19NOV SVO TSE 1020A 0455P
2 KC 873 21NOV W TSE SWO 0830P 0920P
1ADT 465.38

Please issue ticket #1

Sent from my iPhone

1 KC 894 19NOV SVO TSE 1020A 0455P
2 KC 873 21NOV W TSE SVO 0830F 0920P
1ADT 46538

1 SU 1962 19NOV SVO TSE 0935A 0400P
2 sU 1963 21NOV TSE SVO 0500P 0605P
1ADT 44460

Regards,
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova
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Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

She needs to arrive on the 19th and depart on the 21st. Sorry she messed up her days. Let
me know what we can do

Sent from my iPhone

OK

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Ok. | have her email address. Jeffrey wants me to deal with her. So hang in!

Sent from my iPhone

OK, there are no combinable fares, she will have to have two separate tickets on outbound
flight:

SuU 1412 18NOV SVO SWVX 0925A 0155P
TOTAL FARE - USD 63.90
KC 272 18NOV SWX TSE 0425F 0715P

TOTAL FARE - USD 207.39

KC 873 19NOV TSE SVO 0830P 0920P
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suU 1963 19NOV TSE SVO 0500P 0605P
TOTAL FARE - USD 229.70

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Pleas whine me option with stop to arrive 18th also

Sent from my iPhone

Ok. Let me ask

Sent from my iPhone

Best fare on the market is with AIR ASTANA

KC 874 18NOV SVO TSE 1020P 455A 19NOV

KC 873 19NOV TSE SVO 830P 920P

$493.38 restricted and 561,38 refundable.

If to change existing ticket with Aeroflot schedule will be

SU1856 1BNOV SVO TSE 1155P 610A
SU1863 19NOV TSE SWVO S00P 605P

Mew fare 755.60, old fare 577.30, plus EUR35.00 change fee.

To arrive Astana on November 18th will be only flights with one stop.

Regards,
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Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Thx

Sent from my iPhone

Morning, on it.

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Morning! We need a round trip coach ticket for Natalya Litvinova Moscow-Astana early
Sunday Nov. 18th return LATE on Monday Nov 15th.

Matalya Litvinova

P Expires:
Kazakhsta

We have money with a ticket for her...not sure if we can use for this? Rec. Loc#JESQDN

thanks!
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