From: -
Sent: Wed 11/21/2018 1:56:56 PM
Subject: Re: Hotel

Fabulous!!!

Sent from my iPhone

On Nov 21, 2018, at 9:51 AM, Daphne Wallace _ wrote:

Greetings L,
Brittany waived the penalty on both rooms for us. ;) DW

On Wed, Nov 21, 2018 at 8:42 AM _ wrote:

Hi daphne. Sorry | missed your call. You can call the hotel and try to cancel and
get our money back They may have a wait list and be appreciative of the call!
Never know!

Sent from my iPhone
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