
To: 
From: 
Sent 
Subject Re: kaze footrest 

Wed 11/21/2018 3:32:15 PM 

ok drive safe!! 

On Nov 21, 2018, at 10:31 AM, Deirdre Paley 
wrote: 

I will have this to you by the end of the day I'm driving currently. 

Get Outlook for iOS 

From 
Sent: Wednesday, November 21, 2018 10:31 AM 
To: Deirdre Paley 
Subject: Re: kaze footrest 

good morning! please send me corrected invoice when you have a moment...hoping soon 
:) 

On Nov 20, 2018, at 6:55 PM, Deirdre Paley 
wrote: 

Oh no! My cells must be messed up! My apologies! 

I will resend! 
Just confirming you only need one? I have in my messages 2. 
Your cost is 45$ per footrest 

Get Outlook for iOS 

From: 
Sent: Tuesday, November 20, 2018 5:34 PM 
To: Deirdre Paley 
Cc: Patrick Basset 
Subject: Re: kaze footrest 

Hi Deirdre and thank you for attaching the sales order. I am confused however. 
We wanted 1 foot rest....how does the total come to $804.58? How 

much is one footrest and how much is shipping? It appears one foot 
rest is $45.00 but then the total unit price says $490.00? What is the 
$200.00 for? 
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On Nov 20 2018. at 5:25 PM Deirdre Paley 

wrote: 

<Image-21.pngxlmage-22.png> 
Get fikitlic forns

From 
Sent: Tuesday, November 20, 2018 5:24:19 PM 
To: Deirdre Paley 
Cc: Patrick Basset 
Subject: Re: kaze footrest 

HI Deirdre. Can you please send me an email with the attachment. There 
is nothing attached here. I would like to see the order. 
Thank you. 

51 )eirdre Paley 
Tote: 

I applied fekkai discount 

Get Outlook thr iOS 

From: Deirdre Paley <dpaley@takarabelmont.com>

Sent: Tuesday, November 20, 2018 5:21 PM 
To: Patrick Basset 

Cc: 
Subject: Re: kaze footrest 

Get Outlook for ioS 

From: Patrick Basset 
Sent: Tuesday, November 20, 2018 4:30:50 PM 
To: Deirdre Paley 
Subject: Re: kaze footrest 

Hello tnrs Paley 
When I was at the show room on Friday your colleague told me the foot rest was JOSS each 

Let me know why such a difference in price . 
Thank you 
Best regards 
Patrick basset. 
Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 20. 2018. at 14:55. Deirdre Paley wrote: 
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PLEASE SEE A1TACHEMENTS AND 
SIGN ALL PAGES. 

BEST, 

Deirdre Paley 
Regional Sales & 
Design Representative 
17 West 561h 

0019 

<image008.png> 

Confidentiality Note: This e-mail, and any attachment to it, contains privileged and 
confidential information intended only for 
the use of the individual(s) or entity 
named on the e-mail. If the reader of this 
e-mail is not the intended recipient, or the 
employee or agent responsible for 
delivering it to the intended recipient, you 
are hereby notified that reading it is 
strictly prohibited. If you have received 
this c-mail in error, please immediately 
return it to the sender and delete it from 
your system. All messages sent to and 
from our system are automatically 
archived. Thank you. 

<FEKKAI COVER KAZE.pdf> 

<Credit Card Fonn.pdf,

EFTA_R 1_01066892 

EFTA02264584


